
L E G A L  A N D  P R I V A C Y  N O T I C E  

Use of this web site 
  
The owner of this web site is not responsible in any manner for direct, indirect, 
special or consequential damages, however caused, arising out of your use of 
this web site. Links to other web sites from this web site are provided for 
convenience only. No endorsement of any third party web site, services or 
information is expressed or implied by any information, material or content 
referred to or included on, or linked from or to this web site.  
 
 
Information  
 
 
Information provided on this web site is believed to be accurate and reliable 
when placed on this site, but we cannot guarantee it is accurate or complete 
or current at all times. Information on this site is for informational purposes 
only. We endeavor to keep the information posted on this site current. 
However, this information is subject to change and this web site may not 
immediately reflect such changes. 
 
 
Trademarks and copyrights  
 
 
Certain names, words, titles, phrases, logos, icons, graphics or designs in the 
pages of this web site may constitute trade names, registered or unregistered 
trade-marks or service marks of organizations or of third parties.  
 
 
All information on this web site is protected under the copyright laws of 
Canada. Users of this web site are entitled to copy any information for their 
own personal use but may not republish or reproduce any such information in 
any manner without the prior consent of the web site owner. 
 
 
 



Privacy 
 
 
When you visit this web site, the web site owner may obtain some limited 
information about you, including your IP address, the name of your Internet 
Service Provider (ISP) and information concerning your browser and 
operating system. The extent of personal identification depends, in a large 
part, on the naming standards that are followed by your ISP. You may want to 
check with them to inquire about their policies and practices in this regard. 
 
 
When you voluntarily send us electronic mail or complete an electronic form 
that includes identifying information about you, we will keep a record of this 
information so that we can respond to you. 
 
 
Collected personal information will only be used to fulfill the purpose for which 
it was originally collected or for a use consistent with that purpose. This 
information will not be disclosed to other public bodies or individuals except as 
authorized by law. The web site owner will keep the information only for the 
length of time necessary to fulfill the purpose(s) for which it was collected. 
 
 
This website may contain links to other web sites. The web site owner is not 
responsible for the privacy practices of such web sites. 
 
 
Function of website 
 
 
This web site is intended to provide the public with information about 
programs, events and services provided by the web site owner and other 
associated persons or organizations. While they welcome suggestions and 
submissions, only information of the nature for which the web site was 
designed will be considered. The web site owner reserves the right to edit 
and/or reject submissions of information for this web site. 
 
 
 



Credits 
 
 
This web site was designed and built by Terry MacDonald and Brett 
Anderson in Simpson, SK, Canada and utilizes technology provided by Web 
Hosting Canada. For information about web site development, please contact 
the web developer. 
 


